
UNIRISC, Inc. a division of Risk Strategies acquires Willis Relocation Risk 
Group 

 

Business unit purchase adds significant expertise to existing global relocation insurance and risk 
management services capabilities  

 
BOSTON, February 16, 2021 – UNIRISC, the relocation insurance division of leading national specialty 
insurance brokerage and risk management firm Risk Strategies, today announced its acquisition of Willis 
Relocation Risk Group, a specialty business unit which operated within Willis Towers Watson Global 
Marine providing insurance, risk management and claims solutions designed specifically for the mobility 
and relocation industries. Terms of the deal were not disclosed. 
 
Adding to its 2020 acquisition of leading global relocation insurance and risk management specialist 
UNIRISC, the purchase of Willis Relocation Risk Group positions Risk Strategies as the preeminent risk 
management advisor to the global moving and relocation industry. 
 
"We are very excited by the opportunities and synergies this partnership will bring to our clients and 
team members,” said Ken McClinton, Risk Strategies’ Managing Director at UNIRISC. “This simply could 
not be a better fit for both UNIRISC, Willis Relocation and Risk Strategies." 
 
Serving a uniquely complex and demanding market, Risk Strategies’ UNIRISC Division brokerage team 
customizes coverage for everything from vacant homes to household goods on a worldwide basis. Its 
third-party administrator group employs proprietary technology to manage and streamline the claims 
process for self-insured relocation clients. 
 
The Willis Relocation Group operations will be merged into UNIRISC’s operating structure, adding to its 
overall capabilities. This merger of capabilities, experience, and expertise will significantly enhance the 
UNIRISC division’s ability to deliver world-class client service provided while continuing to offer the 
industry's most innovative insurance solution. 
 

ABOUT RISK STRATEGIES  

Risk Strategies is a privately held, rapidly growing national insurance brokerage and risk management 
firm offering comprehensive risk management advice and insurance and reinsurance placement for 
property & casualty, Health Care and employee benefits risks. Risk Strategies serves commercial 
companies, nonprofits, public entities and individuals, and has access to all major insurance markets. 
Ranked among the top brokers in the country, Risk Strategies has offices in more than 100 locations 
nationwide, including Boston, New York City, Chicago, Minneapolis, Miami, Atlanta, Houston, Dallas, 
Nashville, Los Angeles and San Francisco. 

 

https://www.globenewswire.com/news-release/2020/02/18/1986359/0/en/Risk-Strategies-Acquires-UNIRISC-Inc.html

