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Online trading has inherent risk due to system response, execution price, speed, 
liquidity, market data, and access times that may vary due to market conditions, system 
performance, market volatility, size and type of order, and other factors. An investor 
should understand these and additional risks before trading. 
 
Content, news, research, tools, market data and securities symbols are for educational 
and illustrative purposes only and do not imply a recommendation or solicitation to buy 
or sell a particular security or to engage in any particular investment strategy. The 
information provided is not warranted as to completeness or accuracy and is subject to 
change without notice. The information provided should not be considered legal or tax 
advice. Consult an attorney or tax professional regarding your specific situation. The 
projections or other information regarding the likelihood of various investment outcomes 
are hypothetical in nature, are not guaranteed for accuracy or completeness, do not 
reflect actual investment results and are not guarantees of future results. All 
investments involve risk, losses may exceed the principal invested, and the past 
performance of a security, industry, sector, market, or financial product does not 
guarantee future results or returns. Consider the investment objectives, risks, charges, 
and expenses of a fund before investing. Contact us at support@architect.co for a 
prospectus containing this information. Please remember that diversification is not an 
investment strategy without risk, and in certain circumstances, it may not fit your 
investment objectives. 
 
Certain services (“Services”) are offered only in jurisdictions where it is legal to do so. 
The availability of the Services over the Internet is not a solicitation for or offering of the 
Services to any person in any jurisdiction where such solicitation or offering is illegal. 
We reserve the right to limit the availability of the Services to any person, geographic 
area, or jurisdiction, at any time and in our sole discretion. We make no representation 
that the Services are appropriate or available for use in locations outside of the United 
States, or that accessing our Services is legally permitted in countries or territories 
where the Services may be illegal. If you access the Services from other locations, you 
do so at your own risk and are responsible for compliance with local laws. 
 
Options are complex products and are not suitable for all investors. You must read and 
understand the Characteristics and Risks of Standardized Options before buying or 
selling exchange-traded options. The risk of loss is substantial, and you may lose more 
than the principal invested. Options are sensitive to considerable risks including 
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counterparty, early assignment, and expiration risks, among others. The degree of risk 
will vary depending on the strategy.  You should consider your experience, investment 
objectives, and understanding of the characteristics and risks involved before you begin 
trading options. 
 
Investors are advised to thoroughly evaluate the investment objectives, risks, charges, 
and expenses associated with Exchange Traded Funds (ETFs) prior to making any 
investment decisions. For a prospectus that includes this information, please reach out 
to us at support@architect.co. It is essential to read the prospectus carefully. ETFs are 
exposed to market risk, tracking error, and liquidity risk, and may also face 
concentration risk. Furthermore, ETFs are subject to management fees and other 
associated expenses. Investment returns may vary and are influenced by market 
volatility, which means that the value of an investor's shares, upon redemption or sale, 
may be greater or less than the initial investment. These products are designed for 
sophisticated investors who possess a comprehensive understanding of the associated 
risks. 
 
Market data provided by QUODD Financial Information Services, Inc. 
 
Please read Legal Disclosures. 
 
Securities products and services are offered to self-directed investors through Architect 
Securities LLC, Member FINRA / SIPC. Architect Securities LLC and Architect Financial 
Technologies Inc. are separate but affiliated companies. 
 
Securities products are not FDIC insured · Not bank guaranteed · May lose value 
 
FINRA BrokerCheck reports for Architect Securities LLC. 
 
Trademarks and logos are the property of their respective owners and do not represent 
endorsements of any kind. Unless otherwise noted, Architect Financial Technologies 
Inc. and its affiliates are not partners, affiliates, or licensees of these companies. 
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